
PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Supplier Name

Stock Code 1-

295-610 Price QTY Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-630 Price QTY

*Flanders Electric* No Bid No Bid -$                No Bid No Bid No Bid

WESCO Distribution No Bid No Bid -$                No Bid No Bid No Bid

WEG Transformers USA No Bid No Bid -$                No Bid No Bid No Bid

JST Power Equipment 8,980.00$        80 718,400.00$  

 28-30 weeks 

after approval 

196 days 9,730.00$       60

*UTB Transformers* No Bid No Bid -$                No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Subsequently to bid opening both vendors stated they could not honor their bid.* 



PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-670 Price QTY Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-701 Price QTY

-$                 No Bid 50,295.60$     2 100,590.00$   32 weeks 52,930.80$    2

-$                 No Bid 49,660.00$     2 99,320.00$     47 weeks 58,540.00$    2

-$                 No Bid 27,620.00$     2 55,240.00$     92-94 weeks 37,043.00$    2

583,800.00$   

 28-30 weeks 

after approval 

196 days 33,600.00$     2 67,200.00$     196 days 42,000.00$    2

-$                 No Bid 30,176.00$     2 60,352.00$     23 weeks 36,422.00$    2

Subsequently to bid opening both vendors stated they could not honor their bid.* 



PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-721 Price QTY Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-747 Price QTY

105,861.60$  32 weeks 71,053.20$     2 142,106.40$   32 weeks 89,490.60$    2

117,080.00$  47 weeks 80,760.00$     2 161,520.00$   47 weeks 105,460.00$  2

74,086.00$    92-94 weeks 49,561.00$     2 99,122.00$     85-87 weeks 76,608.00$    2

84,000.00$    196 days 49,600.00$     2 99,200.00$     196 days 55,500.00$    2

72,844.00$    23 weeks 48,674.00$     2 97,348.00$     23 weeks 66,640.00$    2



PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-677 Price QTY Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-706 Price QTY

178,981.20$  32 weeks 50,115.60$    2 100,231.20$  32 weeks 52,750.80$    2

210,920.00$  47 weeks 46,875.00$    2 93,750.00$    47 weeks 58,275.00$    2

153,216.00$  85-87 weeks 25,992.00$    2 51,984.00$    92-94 weeks 33,180.00$    2

111,000.00$  196 days 32,260.00$    2 64,520.00$    196 days 40,200.00$    2

133,280.00$  35 weeks 29,232.00$    2 58,464.00$    23 weeks 33,948.00$    2



PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-732 Price QTY Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-741 Price QTY

105,501.60$  32 weeks 70,873.20$      2 141,746.40$    32 weeks 89,310.60$    2

116,550.00$  47 weeks 72,975.00$      2 145,950.00$    47 weeks 93,605.00$    2

66,360.00$    92-94 weeks 41,350.00$      2 82,700.00$      92-94 weeks 53,795.00$    2

80,400.00$    196 days 47,500.00$      2 95,000.00$      196 days 53,000.00$    2

67,896.00$    23 weeks 41,096.00$      2 82,192.00$      23 weeks 56,125.00$    2



PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-755 Price QTY Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-770 Price QTY

178,621.20$  38 weeks 94,312.80$    2 188,625.60$  38 weeks 171,511.20$   2

187,210.00$  47 weeks 113,030.00$  2 226,060.00$  47 weeks 129,100.00$   2

107,590.00$  85-87 weeks 61,551.00$    2 123,102.00$  85-87 weeks 83,773.00$     2

106,000.00$  196 days 56,810.00$    2 113,620.00$  196 days 71,210.00$     2

112,250.00$  23 weeks 64,454.00$    2 128,908.00$  23 weeks 120,581.00$   2



PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-785 Price QTY Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-660 Price QTY

343,022.40$   42 weeks 259,896.60$   2 519,793.20$   49 weeks 35,614.80$    10

258,200.00$   47 weeks 164,390.00$   2 328,780.00$   47 weeks 39,740.00$    10

167,546.00$   85-87 weeks 152,354.00$   2 304,708.00$   85-87 weeks 22,421.00$    10

142,420.00$   196 days 102,000.00$   2 204,000.00$   196 days 28,760.00$    10

241,162.00$   35 weeks 169,408.00$   2 338,816.00$   13 weeks 22,783.00$    10



PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Total Price Lead Time

Stock Code 1-

295-665 Price QTY Total Price Lead Time

356,148.00$  29 weeks 34,041.60$    10 340,416.00$  29 weeks

397,400.00$  47 weeks 38,665.00$    10 386,650.00$  47 weeks

224,210.00$  92-94 weeks 21,387.00$    10 213,870.00$  92-94 weeks

287,600.00$  196 days 27,675.00$    10 276,750.00$  196 days

227,830.00$  23 weeks 21,734.00$    10 217,340.00$  23 weeks



PWC2223024 - Single Phase Three Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers 2023

Manufacturer Plant Grand Total Type Grand Total Type

ERMCO through Maddox Industrial 

Transformers & Short Powerline Services $2,801,644.80 3-PH PAD -$                    1-PH PAD

WESCO (Maddox Industrial Transformers $2,729,390.00 3-PH PAD -$                    1-PH PAD

WEG Transformers USA $1,723,734.00 3-PH PAD -$                    1-PH PAD

JST Power Equipment  (Yangzhou, China) $1,731,710.00 3-PH PAD 1,302,200.00$   1-PH PAD

ERMCO through Maddox Industrial 

Transformers $1,838,682.00 3-PH PAD -$                    1-PH PAD


