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POLE MOUNT, SINGLE PHASE AND THREE (3) PHASE PAD MOUNT DISTRIBUTION TRANSFORMERS CONTRACT CALENDAR YEAR 2025
JULY 27, 2023 @ 2:00 pm

COMPANY NAME lomon JST Power WEG Transformers USA Hyundai Corp (USA) JSHP Transformer USA American Wire Group ECB LLC Alpha Plotter LLC Nexgen Power INC MVA Power Inc ELPOWERTECH (Roise Utility Vijai Electric Limited
CITY/STATE Temple, TX Lake Mary, FL i MO Torrance, CA San Jose, CA Miami, FL Oxford, MS Greenville, NC Gardena, CA Montreal Canada Rocky River, IH Haridwar, L India
MANUFACTURER Sunbelt Solomon JST (China) WEG Transformers USA Hyundai (Korea) JSHP (China) Colombia China China South Korea China South Korea India
WARRANTY 3 Years N/A 12 months from i date N/A 5 years from date of purchase 12 months under normal service N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
LEAD TIMES 44 - 47 Weeks ARO 30 Weeks 87-116 Weeks 9 Months 8 Months 35-40 Weeks 6-10 Weeks 18 Weeks 62 Weeks 30 Weeks 40 Weeks ARO 34-41 Weeks
DESCRIPTION QTY [ UOM PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED
1-295-610 1-PH PAD 50 EA No Bid $ 9,432.00 | $ 471,600.00 [ No Bid $ 8,260.00 | § 413,000.00 8,700.00 | $ 435,000.00 | No Bid 6,035.19 | $ 301,759.50 | $  4,990.00 | $ 249,500.00 7,140.00 | $ 357,000.00 | $ 7,609.70 | $ 380,485.00 | $ 7,859.00 | § 392,950.00 | No Bid
1-295-630 200 EA No Bid $ 10,635.00 | $ 2,127,000.00 | No Bid $ 9,670.00 | § 1,934,000.00 9,520.00 | $ 1,904,000.00 | No Bid 6,790.35 | $ 1,358,070.00 [ $ 5,940.00 | $ 1,188,000.00 8,450.00 | $ 1,690,000.00 [ $ 857210 | $ 1,714,420.00 | $§ 8,693.00 [ $ 1,738,600.00 | No Bid
1-295-640 30 EA No Bid $ 12,095.00 | $ 362,850.00 | No Bid $ 10,760.00 | $ 322,800.00 10,580.00 | $ 317,400.00 | No Bid 7.844.94 | $ 235348.20 [ $  6,500.00 | $ 195,000.00 8,980.00 | $ 269,400.00 [$ 9,670.10 | $ 290,103.00 | § 9,711.00 | § 291,330.00 [ No Bid
1-295-655 30 EA No Bid $ 15,030.00 | $§ 450,900.00 [ No Bid $ 12,070.00 | $ 362,100.00 11,740.00 | $ 352,200.00 | No Bid 8,489.46 | $ 254,683.80 [ $ 7,403.00 | $ 222,090.00 10,230.00 | $ 306,900.00 | $ 11,558.20 | $ 346,746.00 | $ 10,771.00 | § 323,130.00 | No Bid
1-295-695 10 EA No Bid $ 18,600.00 | $ 186,000.00 | No Bid $ 14,350.00 | $ 143,500.00 14,145.00 | $ 141,450.00 | No Bid 9,699.34 | $ 96,993.40 | $ 13,850.00 | $ 138,500.00 12,900.00 | $ 129,000.00 | $ 13,344.10 | § 133,441.00 [ $ 13,370.00 | $ 133,700.00 | No Bid
1-295-066 COV. 12 EA $ 5998.00 [ $ 71,976.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 5,980.00 | § 71,760.00 | No Bid No Bid 430462 | $ 51,655.44 | $§ 3,369.00 | $ 40,428.00 5,360.00 | $ 64,320.00 | $ 5,300.30 | $ 63,603.60 | No Bid $ 3.365.00|$% 40,380.00
1-295-106 6 EA $ 8771.00($ 52,626.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 7,830.00 | § 46,980.00 | No Bid No Bid 511357 | § 30,681.42 |$ 6,365.00 | $ 38,190.00 7,890.00 | $ 47,340.00 |$ 859120 | $ 51,547.20 | No Bid $ 4,196.00 | $ 25,176.00
1-295-015 10 EA $ 4408.00 [ $ 44,080.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 3,800.00 | $ 38,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 230710 [ $ 23,071.00 | $ 1,408.00 | $ 14,080.00 3,630.00 | $ 36,300.00 |$ 2,732.30 | $ 27,323.00 | No Bid $ 1646.00|$ 16,460.00
1-295-030 24 EA $ 4817.00($ 115,608.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 4,350.00 | § 104,400.00 | No Bid No Bid 287448 | $ 68,987.52 | § 2,214.00 | $ 53,136.00 3,580.00 | $ 85,920.00 | $ 3,262.20 | $ 78,292.80 | No Bid $ 1.866.00 | $ 44,784.00
1-295-060 24 EA $ 5998.00 [ $ 143,952.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 5,220.00 | $ 125,280.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,962.56 | $ 95,101.44 |$§ 2,935.00 | $ 70,440.00 4,510.00 | $ 108,240.00 | $ 4,258.10 | § 102,194.40 | No Bid $ 2836.00 % 68,064.00
1-295-080 15 EA $ 7446.00 [ $ 111,690.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 6,520.00 | § 97,800.00 | No Bid No Bid 404072 | $ 60,610.80 | $ 4,394.70 | $ 65,920.50 5,710.00 | $ 85,650.00 | $ 5150.20 | $ 77,253.00 | No Bid $ 3.364.00|$ 50,460.00
1-295-100 15 EA $ 8771.00($ 131,565.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 7,390.00 | § 110,850.00 | No Bid No Bid 477964 | $ 71,694.60 |$ 596170 | $ 89,425.50 6,380.00 | $ 95,700.00 | $ 6,899.50 | $ 103,492.50 | No Bid $ 3943.00|$ 59,145.00
1-295-142 3 EA $ 10,562.00 | $ 31,686.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 9,130.00 | § 27,390.00 | No Bid No Bid 6,517.32 | $ 19,551.96 | $ 8,928.70 | $ 26,786.10 7,930.00 | $ 23,790.00 | $ 8,892.90 | $ 26,678.70 | No Bid $ 4927.00|$% 14,781.00
1-295-016 3 EA $ 4408.00 [ $ 13,224.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 4,460.00 | $ 13,380.00 | No Bid No Bid 267148 | $ 8,01444 ($ 146380 |$ 4,391.40 2,940.00 | $ 8,820.00 | § 2974.90 | $ 8,924.70 | No Bid $ 1648.00|$% 4,944.00
1-295-031 3 EA 48117.00| $ 144,351.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 4,890.00 | § 14,670.00 | No Bid No Bid 277298 | $ 831894 | § 222590 |$ 6,677.70 3,540.00 | $ 10,620.00 | $ 3,549.50 | $ 10,648.50 | No Bid $ 2,018.00 [ $ 6,054.00
1-295-061 3 EA $ 5998.00 [ $ 17,994.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 5,980.00 | § 17,940.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,962.56 | $ 11,887.68 | $ 3,329.30 | $ 9,987.90 4,490.00 | $ 13,470.00 | $ 4,636.30 | $ 13,908.90 | No Bid $ 2860.00|$% 8,580.00
1-295-095 3 EA $ 7446.00 [ $ 22,338.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 7,170.00 | $ 21,510.00 | No Bid No Bid 417571 [ $ 12,527.13 | § 442290 | $ 13,268.70 5,590.00 | $ 16,770.00 | $ 5633.80 | $ 16,901.40 | No Bid $ 3619.00 |8 10,857.00
1-295-125 3 EA $ 8771.00($ 26,313.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 7,830.00 | § 23,490.00 | No Bid No Bid 491565 | $ 14,746.95 | $  6,559.80 | $ 19,679.40 6,460.00 | $ 19,380.00 | $ 744370 | $ 22,331.10 | No Bid $ 4,030.00]|$ 12,090.00
1-295-143 3 EA $ 10,562.00 | $ 31,686.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 10,330.00 | $ 30,990.00 | No Bid No Bid 6,516.30 | $ 19,548.90 | $ 9,293.05| $ 27,879.15 8,230.00 | $ 24,690.00 |$ 9,528.10 | $ 28,584.30 | No Bid $ 488200 % 14,646.00
1-295-330 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4,130.00 | $ 206,500.00 | No Bid No Bid 231420 | $ 115,710.00 | $ 1,710.90 | $ 85,545.00 3,440.00 | $ 172,000.00 | $ 3,367.50 | $ 168,375.00 | No Bid $ 1,844.00 [ $ 92,200.00
1-295-365 200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4,780.00 | $ 956,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,860.27 | $ 572,054.00 | $ 2,588.70 | $ 517,740.00 4,410.00 | $ 882,000.00 | $ 3,749.00 | $ 749,800.00 | No Bid $ 2,076.00 [ $ 415,200.00
1-295-395 100 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5,760.00 | § 576,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 4,097.56 | $ 409,756.00 [ $ 3,600.70 | $ 360,070.00 4,850.00 | $ 485,000.00 [ $ 4,92040 | $ 492,040.00 | No Bid $ 3,088.00 [ $ 308,800.00
1-295-415 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 7,280.00 | § 72,800.00 | No Bid No Bid 447514 | $ 44,751.40 |$ 430120 | $ 43,012.00 6,170.00 | $ 61,700.00 | $ 597540 | $ 59,754.00 | No Bid $ 3,676.00 [ $ 36,760.00
1-295-418 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 8,260.00 | § 82,600.00 | No Bid No Bid 5288.15 | $ 52,881.50 | $ 6,824.70 | $ 68,247.00 6,860.00 | $ 68,600.00 | $ 8,031.00 | $ 80,310.00 | No Bid $ 4234.00 [ $ 42,340.00
1-295-332 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4,780.00 | § 47,800.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,456.30 | $ 24,563.00 | $ 1,902.80 | $ 19,028.00 3,760.00 | $ 37,600.00 |$ 3,661.20 | $ 36,612.00 | No Bid $ 1,945.00 [ $ 19,450.00
1-295-380 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5,330.00 | § 53,300.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,04297 | $ 30,429.70 | $ 2,807.50 | $ 28,075.00 4,320.00 | $ 43,200.00 | $ 4,12580 | $ 41,258.00 | No Bid $ 2,298.00 [ $ 22,980.00
1-295-405 6 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6,520.00 | § 39,120.00 | No Bid No Bid 427417 | $ 25,645.02 | $ 3,909.00 | $ 23,454.00 5,540.00 | $ 33,240.00 | $ 5,389.60 | $ 32,337.60 | No Bid $ 3,144.00 [ $ 18,864.00
1-295-414 3 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 7,930.00 | § 23,790.00 | No Bid No Bid 4,846.63 | $ 14,539.89 | $§ 5486.70 | $ 16,460.10 6,780.00 | $ 20,340.00 |$ 6,561.10 | $ 19,683.30 | No Bid $ 3,860.00 [ $ 11,580.00
1-295-421 3 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 8,700.00 | § 26,100.00 | No Bid No Bid 5,660.66 | $ 16,981.98 [ $ 744970 | $ 22,349.10 7,600.00 | $ 22,800.00 | $ 8,763.60 | $ 26,290.80 | No Bid $ 4395.00 [ $ 13,185.00
1-295-660  3-PH PAD 10 EA 28,670.00 286,700.00 28,760.00 287,600.00 34,472.00 344,720.00 31,960.00 319,600.00 | No Bid No Bid 9,489.24 94,892.40 16,629.20 166,292.00 25,400.00 254,000.00 19,183.90 191,839.00 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-700 10 EA 30,989.00 309,890.00 38,000.00 380,000.00 47,181.00 471,810.00 36,520.00 365,200.00 | No Bid 35,683.88 356,838.80 16,123.28 161,232.80 21,846.90 218,469.00 33,500.00 335,000.00 21,335.30 213,353.00 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-720 5 EA 34,936.00 174,680.00 47,500.00 237,500.00 68,266.00 341,330.00 43,370.00 216,850.00 | No Bid 51,827.42 259,137.10 24,893.89 124,469.45 27,068.70 135,343.50 38,000.00 190,000.00 25,823.20 129,116.00 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-737 5 EA 40,632.00 203,160.00 56,000.00 280,000.00 85,283.00 426,415.00 51,850.00 259,250.00 | No Bid 83,358.07 416,790.35 33,098.14 165,490.70 33,178.10 165,890.50 45,100.00 225,500.00 31,109.20 155,546.00 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-665 10 EA 28,670.00 286,700.00 27,675.00 276,750.00 32,587.00 325,870.00 30,980.00 309,800.00 | No Bid No Bid 10,708.25 107,082.50 17,359.00 173,590.00 24,700.00 247,000.00 18,120.90 181,209.00 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-705 5 EA 30,989.00 154,945.00 36,200.00 181,000.00 44,097.00 220,485.00 35,760.00 178,800.00 [No Bid No Bid 17,139.29 85,696.45 22,437.50 112,187.50 32,800.00 164,000.00 20,511.70 102,558.50 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-725 4 EA 34,936.00 139,744.00 44,000.00 176,000.00 55,122.00 220,488.00 42,280.00 169,120.00 | No Bid No Bid 24,997.42 99,989.68 25,793.75 103,175.00 38,000.00 152,000.00 24,760.30 99,041.20 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-740 6 EA 40,632.00 243,792.00 51,000.00 306,000.00 73,566.00 441,396.00 46,850.00 281,100.00 | No Bid No Bid 34,005.55 204,033.30 32,579.70 195,478.20 44,000.00 264,000.00 29,249.80 175,498.80 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-750 4 EA 48,642.00 194,568.00 57,250.00 229,000.00 79,303.00 317,212.00 53,260.00 213,040.00 | No Bid 75,298.39 301,193.56 31,625.37 126,501.48 31,818.70 127,274.80 51,000.00 204,000.00 34,296.40 137,185.60 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-765 4 EA 60,323.00 241,292.00 76,000.00 304,000.00 107,434.00 429,736.00 63,370.00 253,480.00 | No Bid 118,264.52 473,058.08 39,795.11 159,180.44 48,836.80 195,347.20 61,000.00 244,000.00 41,124.10 164,496.40 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-786 4 EA 115,783.00 463,132.00 118,000.00 472,000.00 182,132.00 728,528.00 80,980.00 323,920.00 |No Bid 155,203.23 620,812.92 50,006.01 200,024.04 61,315.60 245,262.40 89,000.00 356,000.00 57,513.40 230,053.60 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-670 2 EA 28,670.00 57,340.00 33,600.00 67,200.00 61,947.00 123,894.00 35,870.00 71,740.00 | No Bid No Bid 12,538.30 25,076.60 19,681.25 39,362.50 28,000.00 56,000.00 20,776.70 41,553.40 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-701 2 EA 30,989.00 61,978.00 42,000.00 84,000.00 89,626.00 179,252.00 42,390.00 84,780.00 | No Bid No Bid 19,278.91 38,557.82 23,513.80 47,027.60 36,000.00 72,000.00 23,699.00 47,398.00 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-721 2 EA 34,936.00 69,872.00 49,600.00 99,200.00 103,899.00 207,798.00 51,410.00 102,820.00 | No Bid No Bid 27,424.29 54,848.58 31,664.10 63,328.20 42,000.00 84,000.00 28,479.00 56,958.00 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-747 2 EA 40,632.00 81,264.00 55,500.00 111,000.00 158,685.00 317,170.00 61,630.00 123,260.00 | No Bid No Bid 34,824.65 69,649.30 40,012.50 80,025.00 48,000.00 96,000.00 34,296.40 68,592.80 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-677 2 EA 28,670.00 57,340.00 32,260.00 64,520.00 57,390.00 114,780.00 35,110.00 70,220.00 | No Bid No Bid 13,271.13 26,542.26 19,520.30 39,040.60 28,000.00 56,000.00 19,847.80 39,695.60 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-706 2 EA 30,989.00 61,978.00 40,200.00 80,400.00 75,536.00 151,072.00 41,850.00 83,700.00 | No Bid No Bid 20,010.73 40,021.46 22,706.20 45,412.40 36,000.00 72,000.00 22,636.10 45,272.20 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-732 2 EA 34,936.00 69,872.00 47,500.00 95,000.00 95,677.00 191,354.00 46,520.00 93,040.00 | No Bid No Bid 28,156.10 56,312.20 28,600.00 57,200.00 41,000.00 82,000.00 27,417.60 54,835.20 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-741 2 EA 40,632.00 81,264.00 53,000.00 106,000.00 112,489.00 224,978.00 53,480.00 106,960.00 | No Bid No Bid 36,019.31 72,038.62 34,798.40 69,596.80 47,000.00 94,000.00 32,172.10 64,344.20 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-755 2 EA 48,642.00 97,284.00 58,000.00 116,000.00 128,489.00 256,978.00 60,650.00 121,300.00 | No Bid 93,601.62 187,203.24 33,265.61 66,531.22 40,381.20 80,762.40 52,000.00 104,000.00 38,015.10 76,030.20 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-770 2 EA 60,323.00 120,646.00 84,500.00 169,000.00 175,902.00 351,804.00 75,110.00 150,220.00 | No Bid 146,483.88 292,967.76 43,773.91 87,547.82 51,281.20 102,562.40 63,000.00 126,000.00 45,374.20 90,748.40 | No Bid No Bid
1-295-785 2 EA 115,783.00 231,566.00 132,000.00 264,000.00 323,158.00 646,316.00 96,090.00 192,180.00 | No Bid 176,591.94 353,183.88 56,021.91 112,043.82 80,915.60 161,831.20 91,000.00 182,000.00 63,622.90 127,245.80 | No Bid No Bid
TOTAL| 938 4,648,096.00 7,984,520.00 7,033,386.00 10,094,230.00 $ 3,150,050.00 3,261,185.69 6,228,328.55 6,281,819.75 8,879,290.00 7,695,910.70 $ 2,879,710.00 $ 1,357,780.00
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