
BIDDER NAME

CITY/STATE

MANUFACTURER

HUB/DBE

LEAD TIMES

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENDED UNIT PRICE EXTENDED UNIT PRICE EXTENDED UNIT PRICE EXTENDED

Vee-Center Disconnect Switch, 72.5 kV, 350 kV BIL, 1,200 Ampere, 61,000 

Ampere momentary, horizontally- mounted, outdoor type, three-pole, group-

operated, complete with pipe handle operating mechanism, outboard 

bearings, guide, arcing horns with four-hole NEMA flat pads to suit locations 

on drawings to be provided later. 

8,890.00$     17,780.00$     10,573.01$   21,146.02$     20,474.00$   40,948.00$     7,830.00$     15,660.00$     

Vertical-Break Disconnect Switch, 72.5 kV, 350 kV BIL, 1,200 Ampere, 61,000 

Ampere momentary, horizontallymounted, outdoor type, three-pole, group-

operated, complete with pipe handle operating mechanism, outboard 

bearings, guide, arcing horns with four-hole NEMA flat pads to suit location 

on Drawings to be provided later. 

8,885.00$     35,540.00$     9,366.26$     37,465.04$     21,123.00$   84,492.00$     10,954.00$   43,816.00$     

Hook-stick Disconnect Switch, 72.5 kV, 350 kV  BIL,  1200  Ampere,  61,000 

Ampere momentary, horizontally- mounted, outdoor type with four-hole 

NEMA flat pads. Terminals to suit location with copper live parts.  Shown on 

drawings to be provided later.

1,200.00$     14,400.00$     no bid no bid 2,058.00$     24,696.00$     1,395.00$     16,740.00$     

Outdoor Hook-stick Disconnect Switch, 27 kV, 150 kV BIL, single-pole, 1,200 

Ampere continuous, 61,000 Ampere momentary, vertically-mounted, with 

four-hole NEMA flat pads. Terminals to suit location with copper live parts. 

Shown on drawings to be provided later. 

845.00$   60,840.00$     no bid no bid 1,297.00$     93,384.00$     730.00$   52,560.00$     

Vee-Center-Break Disconnect Switch, 27 kV, 150 kV BIL, 2,000 Ampere, 

80,000 Ampere momentary, horizontally- mounted, outdoor type, three-pole, 

group-operated, complete with pipe handle operating mechanism, outboard 

bearings, guide, arcing horns with NEMA four-hole flat pads to suit the 

location shown on the Drawings to be provided later, and have tinned copper 

live parts. 

10,760.00$   21,520.00$     9,970.15$     19,940.30$     no bid no bid 8,075.00$     16,150.00$     

Vee-Center-Break Disconnect Switch, 25 kV, 150 kV BIL, 1,200 Ampere, 

61,000 Ampere momentary, horizontally, mounted, outdoor type, three (3) 

pole, group operated, complete with pipe handle operating mechanism, 

outboard bearings, guide arcing horns with NEMA four-hole flat pads to suit 

the location shown on the Drawings, with copper live parts. 

no bid no bid 9,635.43$     115,625.16$   no bid no bid 8,510.00$     102,120.00$   

Freight 3,950.00$   

154,030.00$   194,176.52$   243,520.00$   247,046.00$   

Bid Tab
PWC2425002 Substation Disconnect Switches

Bid Opening July 25, 2024 2:00 p.m.

MindCore Technologies
Southern Electrical 

Equipment Company, Inc
Southern States LLC Royal Switchgear

Terrebonne, QC Canada Charlotte, NC Hampton, GA Bessemer, AL 

MindCore Technologies SEECO Did not supply Royal Switchgear

Disclaimer: Inclusion of a bid on the bid tab does not indicate that the bid is being considered for award. The bid tab simply represents sealed bids that were submitted on time using the PWC bid pricing form 

(Attachment B) before the bid opening date/time. All bids are subject to further review and evaluation for compliance with the solicitation requirements.

TOTAL 

No No No No

42 weeks 10-12 weeks Did not supply 16  weeks


